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This article provides a framework for 
consideration of two questions: who 
should decide the scope of professional 
nursing? and what criteria should be 
employed in determining the scope of 
professional nursing? It is my view that 
professional as well as practical con­
siderations must be reconciled in 
determining the answers to these 
questions. 

The Role of Legislation , 

Licensure legislation determines 
who is a professional nurse as far as the 
law is concerned, and it does that quite 
well. The legislation also defines the 
scope of professional nursing practice 
for certain purposes, and it does that 
rather imprecisely. It does not define 
the scope of professional nursing prac­
tice so that practitioners of the profes­
sion, practitioners of other health pro­
fessions, administrators of health ser­
vices organizations, and the public at 
large, can easily agree on an answer 
when specific practice questions are 
raised. But is it reasonable to expect 
that a group of legislators sitting in Bos­
ton, or Harrisburg, or some other state' 
capitol can do so? They recognize that 
the nature and scope of nursing prac­
tice will change over time and that each 
modification in practice for profes­
sional nurses need not be controlled by 
specific legislation. 

Legislators function subject to many 
constraints and limitations. Because of 
the interaction of many organizations 
and individuals which seek to affect the 
definitions of practice in licensing legis­
lation for their own benefit, the process 
of writing a definition is laden with 
political difficulties. Various profes­
sions and occupations struggle to pro­
tect their turfs from incursions by other 
competing professions and occupations 
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and, at the same time, to expand their 
areas of practice onto the turfs of their 
competitors. 

This is the way things are, and part 
of the answer to the question of who 
should decide the scope of professional 
nursing practice is that it can not be the 
profession of nursing alone, even if one 
believes that nursing could speak with 
one voice. When one accepts the fact 
that legislation itself is not decisive on 
many issues with regard to the scope of 
professional nursing practice, the ques­
tion becomes: who should participate 
in the ongoing process of refining and 
redefining the scope of professional -
nursing in a changing environment? 

. . . professions . . . struggle to 
protect their turfs from incursions 
. . . and, at the same time, to ex­
pand their areas of practice . . . 

The Role of State Agencies, Officials, 
and Associations 

Historically, several legal processes 
have befen employed in defining the 
scope of professional nursing practice. 
The courts have done so in disposing of 
litigation concerning alleged malprac­
tice on the part of professional nurses. 
They have also done so by their deci­
sions concerning whether nurses have 
violated the medical practice act, or 
some other licensing legislation in the 
state, as well as in determining whether 
persons not licensed as professional 
nurses have violated the nursing prac-

- tice act by engaging in activities re­
served by mandatory legislation to 
professional nurses. 

State associations, implementing the 
concept of joint practice determina­
tions, have also provided clarifications 
or refinements of legislative definitions 
of professional nursing in dealing with 
specific activities and functions. The 
attorneys-general of many states have 
also participated in the definition of 
professional nursing through their re-
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sponses to questions submitted by 
legislators, state boards, and various 
other state agencies. State nursing 
boards, acting separately as well as in 
conjunction with other state licensing 
boards, particularly state boards of 
medicine, have engaged in this defini­
tion process. 

In 19641 authored a short monograph 
entitled Toward Better Definition of 
Nursing, in which I urged that nursing 
and medical boards together resolve is­
sues of whether nurses could engage in 
activities ostensibly on the border of, 
or within, the definition of medicine, 
and not necessarily encompassed by 
the legislative definition of professional 
nursing. I was strongly influenced by 
the naive view that the medical and 
nursing boards, as organs of the state, 
were the most appropriate bodies to 
make these decisions. I felt that they 
would or could have the authority to 
stimulate experiments that would dem­
onstrate the safety and efficacy of 
nurses performing activities which 
raised scope of practice questions 
undeTstrkt interpretation of legislative 
language, and to evaluate their results. 
Service on the state medical board in 
Pennsylvania for approximately five 
years has left me less than enchanted 
with my proposal. I have seen scope of 
practice issues handled by the state 
nursing board and the state medical 
board in Pennsylvania in a fashion that 
strongly suggests the inability of the 
members of the state boards to provide 
answers to these questions. Not all the 
difficulty derives from motivation to 
protect professional turf or enhance a 
profession's stature. Much of it stems 
from lack of understanding of the rele­
vant factors or criteria for making such 
decisions. As a nonphysician member 
of the medical board, I felt that while I 
was less aware of the detail of deter­
mining whether a nonphysician would 
be qualified to carry out specific func­
tions, as a "public" person, I could add 
the dimension of the public's interest in 
the deliberations. 

The presence of public members on 
licensing boards is an increasing na­
tional trend. It is likely that the quality 
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of responses to scope of practice issues 
will be enhanced when persons who are 
not in the regulated professions partici­
pate more heavily in the activities of 
the state licensing boards. 

Criteria for Decision 

No matter who will decide scope of 
practice questions, it is vital that the 
criteria used be understood. As an il­
lustration, consider a question actually 
submitted to state boards with regard to 
the appropriate scope of professional 
nursing practice. A teaching hospital 
seeks to determine whether profes­
sional nurses, trained in the procedure, 
could remove bone marrow for biopsy 
purposes. The reason that the hospital 
desires to have nurses perform the pro­
cedure is that there are insufficient 
physicians, either on the regular staff 
or in training, to perform all of these 
procedures which are required. The 
hospital seeks to make better use of 
personnel and also to reduce costs 
since the cost of the service might well 
be less if it were performed by a profes­
sional nurse rather than by a physician. 
Assume that there are professional 
nurses employed at the hospital who 
are willing to undertake preparation so 
that they can perform this procedure, 
and that some, if not all, of these nurses 
are sufficiently competent and qual­
ified to master the procedure so that 
they will perform it at least as well as 
the physicians who currently are per­
forming the procedure. Are there any 
reasons to determine that this proce- ; 
dure should not be recognized as le­
gally within the scope of professional 
nursing, with the understanding that 
not all nurses will automatically be 
qualified to carry out the procedure 
merely because the procedure is now to 
be defined as within the scope of pro­
fessional nursing practice? 

The first criterion is the public inter­
est. If the procedure can be performed 
by professional nurses at a level of skill 
equivalent to that of physicians, par­
ticularly if the cost to the health system 
will be no greater and perhaps less, it 
would appear from the public interest 
perspective that a redefinition or in­
terpretation of the state licensing laws 
to permit nurses to carry out such a 
procedure is warranted. Some physi­
cians will recognize that to so expand 
the scope of nursing practice might ul­
timately decrease employment oppor­
tunities foi physicians, and will argue 
against expanding nursing practice. 

Some nursing boards would say the 
question is, "Is the procedure profes­

sional nursing?" and answer "No. it is 
medicine." They would go on to say 
that since it is the practice of medi­
cine, there is nothing further for the 
boards to do about the subject. These 
nurses may believe that recognition 
by them that nurses could, let alone 
should, perform such procedures will 
destroy or adversely affect an aspect of 
professional autonomy. The very pro­
cess of seeking medical board concur­
rence or agreement on the subject may 
mean to them that the nursing profes­
sion is accepting the idea that the medi­
cal profession, to some extent, may de­
fine the scope of professional nursing. 
Their position may be simply that 
nurses should not enter upon areas rec­
ognized within the practice of medi­
cine, and that their role is to define or 
expand professional nursing in its inde­
pendent or autonomous areas only, not 
in the area of the diagnostic and thera­
peutic activities that physicians order. 
But a second criterion, the economic 
position of nurses, must be considered. 

On a purely pragmatic economic . 
basis, expanding the procedures nurses 
may legally perform can only enhance 
the opportunities for better compensa­
tion. In an ideal sense, perhaps, this 
shouldn't be the case. But the world we 
all live and work in is far from ideal. 
More importantly, if professional 
nurses are barred from performing 
bone marrow aspiration, and physi­
cians are not sufficiently available to 
perform the procedure in the necessary 
volume, then, as has been the case time' 
and time again, a technician or thera­
pist will emerge as the delegate of the 
physician to perform the procedure, 
and also to do some traditional nursing 
as well for the patient, and nursing will 
be powerless to interfere. Note that 
nothing prevents individual nurses 
from making personal decisions not to 
perform traditionally medical tasks. 

Nothing prevents individual nurses 
from making personal decisions not 
to perform traditionally medical 
tasks. 

Some nurses may believe that if 
nurses expand their technical tasks 
they will be neglecting the planning, 
counseling and other pure nursmg 
functions. However, technical tasks 
and support and counseling of patients 
are inextricably intertwined. Consider 
bone marrow aspiration once more. Is 
it not to the advantage of the patient to 
have the practitioner who performs the 
procedure be also one who can and is 
willing to speak with understanding and 
compassion about the procedure and 

the condition that requires the proce­
dure to be performed, and who can as­
sist the patient in dealing with his 
fears? 

Thus, expansion of the scope of nurs-

. . . expanding the procedures 
nurses may legally perform can only 
enhance the opportunities for better 
compensation. 

ing practice to include some aspects of 
medical practice can serve the public 
interest and can serve the economic 
interests of nurses as well. Are there 
countervailing factors? 

Autonomy vs. Economic Realities 

Currently there are pressures for 
some nurses to expand their practice to 
encompass ordering of medication for 
patients, including even the writing of 
prescriptions. This is the result, in part, 
of the development and legal recogni­
tion of nurse practitioners. An ex­
panded role is now countenanced by 
much of the medical profession for 
nurse practitioners. In Oregon, the 
state medical board will grant prescrib­
ing authority to nurse practitioners 
who meet certain standards, for medi­
cations included within a formulary 
developed jointly by a council on which 
nurses, physicians and pharmacists sit. 
Is this nursing? Perhaps not. because 
the state medical board has the statuto­
ry authority to suspend or revoke the 
prescribing privileges if abused. On the 
other hand, if nurses can possess such 
authority, what once was exclusively 
medicine has become a shared or joint 
function. If it is safe for patients, we 
should applaud the development, al­
though it does depart from the ideal of 
nursing autonomy as some conceive it. 
In this illustration the legislature, med­
icine, nursing and pharmacy all partici­
pate in creating the expanded role for 
nurse practitioners. 

A recent court decision1 has raised a 
tricky issue regarding nurses following 
PRN orders, which has implications for 
the expansion of the scope of profes­
sional nursing practice into traditional 
medical practice areas. The California 
court has held that the nurse, in decid­
ing whether to administer the medica­
tion, is held not to the standard of a 
member of the medical profession but 
to that of nurses. To the extent this sug­
gests a "lower" standard of care, the 
result may be to discourage this type of 
delegation to nurses. Many lawyers in 
the health field take the view that a 
nurse should be held to the standard of 
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the medical profession in carrying out 
any functions or duties that are gener­
ally recognized as within medical prac­
tice. The rationale for this position is 
that, assuming the medical standard to 
be higher, the public interest is not 
served by acceptance in any form of 
the notion that an appropriate utiliza­
tion of nurses is to lower the quality of 
service patients are entitled to receive. 
This would appear to be the view nurs­
ing should adopt. 

There have been a host of statements 
pointing to the shortage of professional 
nurses in many parts of the United 
States. In some communities, such as 
Pittsburgh, a number of hospitals are 
relying upon agencies and registries to 
provide professional nurses, because 
the hospitals are unable to hire ade­
quate numbers of qualified persons to 
meet their stated complement of pro­
fessional nurses. Use of agency nuVscs 
is not a very healthy development be­
cause it appears that a good many 
nurses who work through the agencies 
lack the appropriate degree of com­
mitment to the patients at the institu­
tions where they provide services. 
Agency nurses move from one institu­
tion to another frequently and they 
often fail to develop the necessary rap­
port with, and interest in the patients 
that they serve: continuity of nursing 
care is lost. 

. . . expansion of (he scope of 
nursing practice . . . can serve the 
public interest and can serve the 
economic interests of nurses as well. 

Why is it that the shortage of licensed 
professional nurses is so severe? It was 
reported in HOSPITALS,2 a publication 
of the American Hospital Association, 
that although more than 2,000,000 per­
sons in the United States have received 
nursing licenses, the total number of 
nurses providing direct patient care is 
between 350,000 and 400,000, and 
many of these hold supervisory posi­
tions. This state of affairs may be a re­
flection of the inadequate compensa­
tion provided to many professional 
nurses who work in health institutions, 
and the conditions in which they work. 
The environment in which many hospi­
tal nurses work cannot be radically 
changed, particularly in an era of cost 
containment. But nurses should be sen­
sitive to the economics and the practi­
cal elements of the environment. Asa 
short term step, nursing needs to con­
solidate the position of professional 
nurses within health organizations, be­
cause the alleged nursing shortage may 

well be the result of nurses deciding 
that there are greener pastures than 
long term employment as professional 
nurses in hospitals. The education and 
experience of a professional nurse can 
be used, at least as a strong base, for 
work other than service to patients. 

The relationship of these realities to 
scope of practice decisions is: if nurses 
are not willing and able to assume re­
sponsibilities and perform tasks that 
arguably fall within the definition of 
medicine, even though a legitimate 
case can be made to encompass them 
within professional nursing, reorgani­
zation of services within hospitals will 
accelerate. The results of the reorgani­
zation will be to emphasize the roles of 
a plethora of technicians and thera­
pists, and diminish further the status of 
professional nurses and the need for 
them. Increased utilization of licensed 
practical nurses and nurse aides and 
orderlies will accompany this. 

No one can state with certainty 
whether such a development would be 
good or bad for professional nursing, 
but it is my impression that profes­
sional nursing is likely to suffer if that 
development takes place. In that con­
text professional nurses will be per­
forming almost exclusively the inde­
pendent, autonomous duties of profes­
sional nurses, as recognized in the 
basic definitions of nursing in the nurs­
ing practice acts. But there may be an 
element of delusion because, as auton­
omous and independent as some pro-

; fessional nurses may see themselves 
because of some statutory definitions, 
as salariedemployees in almost every 
work setting professional nurses lack 
the kind of autonomy that marks some 
other professions. What makes a pro­
fession autonomous is not how the pro­
fession is defined in the law or within a 
larger societal context, but how well 
the individual professionals within the 
profession can control their access to 
clients, on one hand, and the money for 
the services rendered on the other. This 
is not to deride the quest for autonomy 
by professional nurses; it is only to 
suggest that it is not the only^oal for 
which nurses should strive. 

. . .whether it is just or unjust, 
"doctor's work" pays bettern than 
"nurse's work," even when it is per­
formed by nurses. 

There are many categories of techni­
cians, therapists and technologists in 
health institutions who earn more than 
staff nurses, although they have no 

more, and often less, post-secondary 
school education. And for most of 
them, weekend, evening and night 
shifts are rarely, if ever, necessary. For 
example, at a hospital with which I am 
familiar the entry salary for nurses with 
a B.S. degree in nursing is $12,600 per 
year. A radiologic technologist's entry 
salary at this hospital is $14,019, and a 
registered physical therapist enters at 
$16,300. The radiologic technologist 
has less post-secondary education than 
the baccalureate nurse, the registered 
physical therapist has the same amount 
as the nurse. The professional nurses at 
this hospital who are relatively well 
compensated are those who are qual­
ified to perform extra corporeal 
technology — perfusion techniques — 
which suggests that, whether it is just 
or unjust, "doctor's work" pays better 
than "nurse's work," even when it is 
performed by nurses. 

. . . the hospitals are unable to 
hire adequate numbers of qualified 
persons to meet their stated com­
plement of professional nurses. 

In this context the comparable work 
theory of job evaluation should be 
mentioned. Very briefly, the theory is 
that women have been relegated by 
employers to lower paying jobs, and 
that a dual wage structure (paying men 
more than women for work of compar­
able value to the employer) constitutes 

, sex based discrimination under Title 
VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964. In­
creasing the overlap of professional 
nursing with medicine in terms of 
functions and tasks, given the great 
disparity between physician and nurse 
compensation paid by health services 
providers, might be useful in establish­
ing that nursing (female) jobs have been 
consistently underevaluated compared 
to physician (male) jobs. Court tests of 
the theory have been few so far, and 
mostly unsuccessful,3 and the impact of 
licensure of many health professions, 
with different statutory definitions, is 
unclear. Nevertheless, the effect of the 
articulation of the theory upon the 
health services industry could still be 
substantial, by influencing the evalua­
tion of nursing services and wage struc­
tures of health services providers. 

Consider again the criteria for an­
swering the scope of practice question. 
Will it usually be difficult to determine 
whether professional nurses can be­
come qualified to perform particular 
tasks and procedures at an acceptable 
level in terms of public protection? Past 
experience suggests it usually will not. 
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The reason is that before such a ques­
tion is raised for consideration at the 
state level, there has already been a 
fairly substantial number of the proce­
dures performed by nurses or other 
non-physicians. Thus, there is already 
a working hypothesis that professional 
nurses can be prepared to perform the 
procedures. Almost any time such a 
question is submitted to a state board 
by a legitimate provider institution or 
organization, one might assume that 
the objective answer with respect to 
the public interest criteria — safety and 
efficiency — is yes. However, that 
does not guarantee that the public 
interest criterion will be given serious 
attention. The board, or boards, may 
be dilatory in responding, or answer in 
the negative, because their agenda is 
different. A state nursing board de­
liberating on a scope of practice issue 
should, if the board is not going to re­
strict itself to the public interest crite­
rion, at least not adopt a negative posi­
tion regarding expansion of nursing 
into medicine, with the belief that its 
position is good for professional nurses 
working on the firing line. The state 
medical board, if it is participating, and 
the attorney-general, if consulted, can 
usually be relied upon for a negative 
view. 

. . . do some nurses, when serving 
on nursing boards, lose the ability to 
understand what comprises the real 
world of nursing? 

One additional comment concerns 
the exercise of discretion by nursing 
boards in carrying out their disciplinary 
functions. There appears to be a will­
ingness on the part of some nursing 
boards to pursue disciplinary action 
against professional nurses in situa­
tions when the facts, ascertainable by a 
thorough investigation, would indicate 
such action was unwarranted. In Tuma 
v. Board of Nursing* the nurse had 
been charged with interfering with the 
physician-patient relationship by dis­
cussing alternative treatments with the 
patient, and thus engaging in unprofes­
sional conduct. Although the Idaho 
Supreme Court decision in favor of the 
nurse was based on a strictly legal is­
sue, there is a hint in the court's opin­
ion that the court did not believe the 
nurse had done anything warranting 
disciplinary action. A Pennsylvania 
court* found, upon review of the evi­
dence, that a nurse, reprimanded by 
the state nursing board for slapping a 
patient's hand, was justified because 
the patient had failed to release his grip 
on the nurse's arm after the nurse had 

both asked him to let go and attempted, 
unsuccessfully, to pry his fingers loose. 
The question may well be asked: do 
some nurses, when serving on nursing 
boards, lose the ability to understand 
what comprises the real world of nurs­
ing? 

. . . nursing as a profession 
should . . . make certain that 
nurses, willing to provide the ser­
vices, are given the opportunity . . . 
and . . . education or training as is 
necessary. 

Conclusion 

In articles by nurses, and statements 
at conferences about nursing by nurses, 
the remark is often made that "nursing 
is its own worst enemy." You don't see 
or hear that remark about medicine or 
law by these professions as frequently. 
Perhaps it is because the leadership of 
these professions have taken the view 
that their members could doeyerything 
they claimed they could, or at least 
didn't seek to circumscribe role devel­
opment. How many times has a medi­
cal practitioner of modest, or even de­
clining skills become the chief execu­
tive or medical director of a hospital, 
because a physician can do almost 
anything? How many attorneys have 
served as executives in both the private 
and public sectors without any prepara­
tion apart from law study and practice? • 
A physician once asked me — his ques­
tion was tinged with venom — why it 
seemed that only an attorney could 
ever sferve as Secretary of Health, 
Education and Welfare, particularly 
since attorneys knew little about any of 
the three? 

An article with the engaging title, 
The False Professionalism: Profes­
sionalism in Nursing, emanating from 
an aggregation of nurses called the Bos­
ton Nursing Group contains this state­
ment: 

As nurses, we have the goals of bet­
ter patient care and beTter working 
conditions. We decided to look be­
yond nursing, at the rest of the hospi­
tal. Who else shares our problems, 
and our goals? And why areThese 
goals so difficult to achieve?* 

All nurses probably share these 
goals, and most would like to know 
the answers to the questions. When a 
scope of practice question arises re­
specting whether nurses can provide 
services generally viewed as medicine. 

the answer should be viewed (if these 
goals are those of nurses) in the light of 
these goals. Generally, expanding the 
scope of nursing will be consistent with 
these goals. Assuming any flexibility in 
the statutory definitions, the actions of 
nursing as a profession should be to 
make certain that nurses, willing to 
provide the services, are given the op­
portunity to do so and are assisted to 
attain such additional education or 
training as is necessary. Nurses should 
leave the raising of legal and other im­
pediments to others; there are enough 
of those folks around already. 
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